ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance amending Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal Code to
incorporate by reference certain portions of the 2018 International Building Code and
the 2019 Edition of the California Building Code and to make local administrative,
climatic, geologic or topographical changes.

WHEREAS, California Heaith and Safety Code Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7
authorize the City Council to make reasonably necessary changes or modifications to
the provisions of the California Building Standards Code (Title 24, California Code of
Regulations) upon finding these changes are reasonably necessary due to local
administrative, climatic, geologic or topographical conditions;

WHEREAS, the City of Los Angeles has geological conditions, such as the San
Andreas Fault and other earthquake faults, which run through, adjacent and under the

City;

WHEREAS, the City of Los Angeles is located iin Seismic Zone 4, which is
considered by experts to be the most seismically active of the four seismic zones in the
world;

WHEREAS, seismic experts predict a massive earthquake on one of these faults
within the next 30 years and several earthquakes similar in intensity to the 1994
Northridge Earthquake (6.8 magnitude) during the same period;

WHEREAS, massive earthquakes pose unusual and extraordinary stresses on
buildings and structures requiring more stringent building regulations than would
otherwise be required;

WHEREAS, in 1999, large pockets of methane gas in the subsurface geological
formation were discovered in various areas of the City of Los Angeles;

WHEREAS, the City of Los Angeles has topographic conditions, natural and
man-made, such as the natural hills, mountains and the coastal region, as well as the
man-made harbors and highly concentrated areas of high-rise buildings;

WHEREAS, the City of Los Angeles has flat land and hillside areas that create a
natural basin with high strong winds which contribute to the spread of fires;

WHEREAS, in the highly concentrated area of high-rise buildings, traffic
congestion and possible gridlock may jeopardize the quick response to fires by the Fire
Department;

WHEREAS, the City of Los Angeles has climatic conditions, which subject it to a
mild winter, an extremely hot desert-like summer, and hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds that



make the temperature rise and the humidity drop, increasing the fire danger to all
exposed combustible materials; and

WHEREAS, in support of the following maodifications and changes, the City
Council hereby expressly finds that the following amendments and modifications to the
California Building Standards Code are reasonably necessary due to local
administrative, climatic, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE,

THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF LOS ANGELES
DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The second paragraph of Subsection 91.101.1 of Section 91.101,
Division 1, Article 1, Chapter IX of the Los Angeles Municipal Code (LAMC) is amended
to read as follows:

The Los Angeles Building Code and the Los Angeles Residential Code adopt by
indicated reference portions of the 2019 California Building Code (CBC) or the 2019
California Residential Code (CRC) located at Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations (CCR).

Sec. 2. Subsection 91.101.3 of Section 81.101, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter IX
of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.101.3. Application. Chapters 1 through 97 of the LABC as published by the
International Code Council (hereinafter referred to as the published code), are Divisions
1 through 97, respectively, of Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC. Only the division and
section numbers are stated in the published code, for uniformity with the CBC. For the
complete LAMC section number, each code section number specified in Chapters 1
through 97 of the published code shall be presumed to be preceded by two digits and a
decimal point (specifically “91.”). For example, this section is Section 91.101.3 of the
LAMC.

Sec. 3. Subsection 91.106.1.3 of Section 91.1086, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.106.1.3. Temporary Permits. Before commencing the construction of any work for
temporary use, a building permit authorizing such work shall be obtained from the
Department. Such construction shall be occupied or used only for the period set forth
on the permit application, but shall not exceed 180 days.

Except for tents and bleachers, application for permit shall be filed at least seven
days prior to the construction, erection or operation of any device, structure, or any work
regulated by this article for temporary use.



All temporary construction or installations shall be demolished or removed within
five days after the expiration of the Certificate of Occupancy. Requests for inspection
must be received by the department at least two days prior to public use or occupancy.

Sec. 4. Subsection 91.106.3.2.2 of Section 91.1086, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.106.3.2.2. Number of Sets of Plans. Each application for a permit shall be
accompanied by two sets of plans and specifications for plan checking.

The number of sets of plans and specifications submitted with each application
for a building permit shall comply with the regulations of LAMC Subdivision 91.106.3 of
this Code.

EXCEPTION: The Superintendent of Building may waive the requirement
for plans and specifications as required in this article if the Superintendent of
Building finds that the information on the application is sufficient to show that the
work will conform to the provisions of this Code and other relevant laws.

Sec. 5. Subsection 91.106.3.3.1 of Section 91.1086, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.106.3.3.1. General. All plans and specifications submitted to the Department for
checking shall be drawn with ink or indelible pencil, or shall be made by a reproduction
process approved by the department. The first sheet of each set of plans and

specifications shall give the street address of the work and the name and address of the
owner of the building.

The plans and specifications shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the nature
and extent of the proposed work and to show in detail that it will conform to the
provisions of this Code and of relevant laws, ordinances, rules, regulations and orders.

Plans for buildings more than two stories in height of other than Group R,
Division 3 and Group U Occupancies shall indicate how required structural and fire
resistive integrity will be maintained where a penetration will be made for electrical,
mechanical, plumbing and communication conduits, pipes and similar systems.

In lieu of detailed specifications, the Department may approve reference on the
plans to a specific section, subsection or paragraph of this Code or other ordinance or
law.

Distances and dimensions on the plans, when required to show conformity with
the provisions of this Code, shall be done in figures.



When required by LAMC Subsection 91.1704.3, a statement of special inspection
prepared by the registered engineer or licensed architect responsible for the design of
the project shall be included with the set of plans.

Sec. 6. Subsection 91.106.3.3.3 of Section 91.106, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.106.3.3.3. Design Professional in Responsible Charge. Where it is required that
documents be prepared by a registered design professional, the Superintendent of
Building shall have authority to require the owner or owner’s authorized agent to engage
and designate on the building permit application a registered design professional who
shall act as the registered design professional in responsible charge. If the
circumstances require, the owner or the owner’s authorized agent shall designate a
substitute registered design professional in responsible charge who shall perform the
duties require of the original registered design professional in responsible charge. The
Superintendent of Building shall be notified in writing by the owner or owner's
authorized agent if the registered design professional in responsible charge is changed
or is unable to continue to perform the duties.

The registered design professional in responsible charge shall be responsible for
reviewing and coordinating submittal documents prepared by others, included phased
and deferred submittal items for compatibility with the design of the building.

Sec. 7. A new Subsection 91.106.3.3.3.1 is added to Section 91.106, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC to read as follows:

91.106.3.3.3.1. Deferred Submittals. Deferral of any submittal items shall have the
prior approval of the Superintendent of Building. The registered design professional in
responsible charge shall list the deferred submittals on the construction documents for
review by the Superintendent of Building.

Documents for deferred submittal items shall be submitted to the registered
design professional in responsible charge who shall review them and forward them to
the Superintendent of Building with a notation indicating that the deferred submittal
documents have been reviewed and found to be in general conformance to the design
of the building. The deferred submittal items shall not be installed until the deferred
submittal documents have been approved by the Superintendent of Building.

Sec. 8. A new Subsection 91.106.3.3.5 is added to Section 91.106, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC to read as follows:

91.106.3.3.5. Exterior Balconies and Elevated Walking Surfaces. Where balconies
or other elevated walking surfaces are exposed to water from direct or blowing rain,
snow, or irrigation, and the structural framing is protected by an impervious moisture
barrier, the construction documents shall include details for all elements of the



impervious moisture barrier system. The construction documents shall include
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Sec. 9. Paragraph A of Exception 15 of Subsection 91.106.4.1 of Section
91.106, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

A. The applicant incorporates into the development to the satisfaction
of the Bureau of Sanitation of the Department of Public Works, best management
practices necessary to control storm water pollution in accordance with the “Low
Impact Development Ordinance” (Ord. No. 181,899) and the “Planning and Land
Development Best Management Practices Handbook, Low Impact Development
Manual, Part B Planning Activities” adopted by the Board of Public Works as
authorized by LAMC Section 64.72; and

Sec. 10. Subsection 91.107.3.2 of Section 91.107, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
X of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.107.3.2. Preinspection Fees. The Department shall collect a fee of $121.00 for
each of the following:

1: Grading Preinspection. A grading preinspection fee shall be
collected for any building permit application involving work in the hillside grading
area and for all grading plans submitted tc the Department.

EXCEPTION: The grading preinspection fee may be waived when
the Department determines that the nature of the work does not require
preinspection of the work site.

2. Sign Preinspection. A sign preinspection fee shall be collected
when a permit application is filed for construction, replacement, alteration or
repair of a sign.

EXCEPTION: The sign preinspection fee may be waived when the
Department determines that the nature of the sign does not require
preinspection of the proposed location to determine compliance with
applicable requirements.

3. Demolition Preinspection. A demolition preinspection fee shall
be collected for all proposed demolition of buildings (including accessory
buildings) or structures on a site and shall be conducted before the issuance of a
demolition permit.

EXCEPTION: The demolition preinspection and demolition
preinspection fee may be waived when the Department determines that
previous inspections associated with the Department’s abatement
programs have been made.



4. Preinspection. Preinspection fee shall be collected whenever the
Department determines that due to the nature of the work involved, an inspection
is necessary.

Sec. 11. Subdivision 3 of Subsection 91.107.4.6.4 of Section 91.107, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

3. The repair, renovation or rehabilitation of a building or structure for
the installation of fire sprinklers pursuant to Division 9, Article 1, Chapter IX of the
LAMC.

Sec. 12. Subsection 91.107.4.7 of Section 91.107, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.107.4.7. Affordable Housing Linkage Fee. Before issuance of a building permit
for any development project, the Department of Building and Safety shall affix to the
permit an Affordable Housing Linkage Fee per LAMC Section 19.18.

The Department of Building and Safety shall determine which exceptions apply to
any project based on documentation submitted by the applicant prior to the issuance of
the building permit per LAMC Section 19.18.B.2.

EXCEPTION: The notice required by this section shall not be affixed to
building permits for the following projects or portion thereof:

1: Any project for which a building permit is issued with less
than 40,000 square feet (3716 m 2) of new floor area as determined by the
Department of Building and Safety;

2. Any project located within the boundaries of an enterprise
zone designated in LAMC Section 12.04;

3. Any project developed by nonprofit entities such as
hospitals, schools, religious institutions, museums, day care providers and
other similar organizations, where the construction is directly related to the
nonprofit purpose of the organization as determined by the Housing and
Community Investment Department. This exception shall not apply to
nonprofit development of leasable commercial office space;

4. Any project or portion of a project for industrial, warehouse
development or parking structures as defined by the Los Angeles
Municipal Code and determined by the Department of Building and Safety;

5. Any project within a current neighborhood Community
Redevelopment Agency project area as defined in LAMC Section 12.04



other than the Bunker Hill, Central Business District and Little Tokyo
redevelopment areas;

6. Any development project where one or more of the foilowing
discretionary approvals, initiated by application of the property owner or
their representatives, was granted by a government agency between
January 1, 1986 and October 1, 1989 and remains valid: zone change,
conditional use permit, variance, height district change, zone boundary
adjustment, specific plan exception, project permit pursuant to a
moratorium ordinance, development agreement, coastal development
permit, commercial comer development, project permit pursuant to an
interim control ordinance, parcel map, tract map or vesting tentative tract
map.

In addition, prior to the issuance of any such building permit, the
Department of Planning shall certify in writing that the necessary
environmental clearances were completed and that the discretionary
approval included a determination of one or more of the following: building
location, height, density, use, parking and access of the proposed project;

p 42 Any project for which architectural and structural plans
sufficient for a complete plan check for a building permit have been
accepted by the Department of Building and Safety and for which plan
check fees were collected on or before the effective date of this section
and for which no subsequent changes are made to those plans which
increase the height, floor area or occupancy load by more than 5 percent;

8. Any project for an existing building which will not result in the
addition of over 40,000 square feet (3716 m 2) of new space as
determined by the Department of Building and Safety; and

9. Residential buildings which contain one or more dwelling
units, efficiency dwelling units, apartment units or the residential portion of
a building that has both residential and nonresidential uses. This
exception shall not apply to hotels.

10.  Any project located within the boundaries of the Central City
West Specific Plan Area, as defined in Ordinance No. 163,094, if the
developer or project owner agrees by covenant and agreement or
development agreement to abide by the linkage fee and replacement
housing obligations set forth in the Specific Plan for the Central City West
Specific Plan Area.

11.  The repair, renovation or rehabilitation of a building or
structure of historical, archaeological or architectural consequence, if such
building or structure has been officially designated, or has been




determined by state or federal action to be eligible for designation, on the
National Register of Historic Places, or has been included on the City of
Los Angeles list of Historic Cultural Monuments.

The Department of Building and Safety shall determine which exceptions apply to
any project based on documentation submitted by the applicant prior to the issuance of
the building permit.

Sec. 13. A new Subsection 91.108.6.1 is added to Section 91.108, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC to read as follows:

91.108.6.1. Weather Exposed Balcony and Walking Surface Waterproofing.

Where balcony or other elevated walking surfaces are exposed to water from direct or
blowing rain, snow, or irrigation, and the structural framing is protected by an impervious
moisture barrier, all elements of the impervious moisture barrier system shall not be
concealed until inspected and approved.

Sec. 14. Subsection 91.108.8 of Section 91.108, Division 1, Article 1, Chapter IX
of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.108.8. Surveys. In the absence of any designation of the proper location of the lot
or the building to be erected on the lot, for which building a permit has been issued or
for which an application for a building permit has been filed, or as requested in a written
notice from the Department, the Department may require the owner to have the lot
surveyed and staked by a registered civil engineer, licensed prior to January 1, 1982, or
a registered land surveyor, so that the proper location of the lot or the building on the lot
may be determined or the location of the required features in the Department’s written
notice may be determined.

Sec. 15. Subdivision 1 of Subsection 91.108.12.3 of Section 91.108, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

1: The certified licensed contractor has a valid Certificate of Registration
obtained in accordance with LAMC Subsection 91.1704.1.

Sec. 16. The first sentence of Subsection 91.109.7 of Section 91.109, Division 1,
Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Notwithstanding the provisions of LAMC Subsection 91.109.5, whenever public
improvements are required in connection with the replacement or restoration of a
building destroyed or damaged during the local emergency declared by the Mayor in
April 1972, the completion of those public improvements may be deferred until June 1,
1995, and a temporary Certificate of Occupancy may issue for the new or restored
building, or a portion thereof, prior to the completion of the public improvements.



Sec. 17. The first sentence of Section 91.202, Division 2, Article 1, Chapter IX of
the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Section 202 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except that the following CBC
definitions are not adopted:

APPROVED AGENCY
APPROVED FABRICATOR
BUILDING LINE

BUILDING OFFICIAL
DEPARTMENT

Sec. 18. The following definitions in Section 91.202, Division 2, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC are amended to read as follows:

APPROVED AGENCY or APPROVED TESTING AGENCY. An established and
recognized agency regularly engaged in conducting tests or furnishing inspection
services which has been approved by the Superintendent of Building.

NON-DUCTILE CONCRETE BULDING. A concrete building that was built
pursuant to a permit application for a new building submitted before January 13, 1976,
or, if no permit can be located, is determined by the Department to have been built
under building code standards enacted before January 13, 1976.

EXCEPTION: “Non-Ductile Concrete Building” shall not include detached
single-family dwellings or duplexes.

Sec. 19. The definition of Occupancy in Section 91.202, Division 2, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 20. The definition of Substantial Structural Damage in Section 91.202,
Division 2, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 21. The following definition in Section 91.202, Division 2, Article 1, Chapter
IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

TEMPORARY. Buildings and facilities intended for use at one location for
not more than 180 days and seats intended for use at one location for not more
than 90 days.

Sec. 22. Section 91.703, Division 7, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:



Section 703 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except that Section 703.3 of the
CBC is not adopted and, in lieu, LAMC Subsection 91.703.3 is added.

Sec. 23. Subsection 91.703.3 of Section 91.703, Division 7, Article 1, Chapter IX
of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.703.3. Methods for Determining Fire Resistance. The application of any of the
methods listed in this section shall be based on the fire exposure and acceptance
criteria specified in ASTEM E 119 or UL 263. The required fire resistance of a building
element, component or assembly, shall be permitted to be established by any of the
following methods or procedures:

y 7 Fire-resistance designs documented in approved sources.

2 Prescriptive designs of fire-resistance-rated building elements,
component or assemblies as prescribed in CBC Section 721.

3. Calculations in accordance with CBC Section 722.

4, Engineering analysis based on a comparison of building element,
component or assembly designs having fire-resistance ratings as determined by
the test procedures set forth in ASTM E 119 or UL 263.

5. Alternative construction methods as allowed by LAMC Subsection
91.104.2.6.

6. Fire-resistance designs certified by an approved agency.

Sec. 24, Section 91.1207 of Division 12, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
renumbered as Section 91.1206 and amended to read as follows:

SEC. 91.1206. SOUND TRANSMISSION.

Section 1206 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except CBC Section 1206.1, is
not adopted and, in lieu, LAMC Subsections 91.1206.1, 91.1206.1.2, 91.1206.6,
91.1206.7, 91.1206.8, 91.1206.9, 91.1206.9.1, 91.1206.10, 91.1206.11, 91.1206.12,
91.1206.13, 91.1206.14, 91.1206.14.1, 91.1206.14.2, 91.1206.14.3, 91.1206.15.4,
91.1206.16 and 91.1206.17 are added.

Sec. 25. Subsections 91.1207.1, 91.1207.1.2, 91.1207.6, 91.1207.7, 91.1207.8,
91.1207.9, 91.1207.9.1, 91.1207.10, 91.1207.11, 91.1207.12, 91.1207.13, 91.1207.14,
91.1207.14.1, 91.1207.14.2, 91.1207.15.4, 91.1207.16 and 91.1207.17 of Section
91.1207, Division 12, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC are respectively renumbered as
Subsections 91.1206.1, 91.1206.1.2, 91.1206.6, 91.1206.7, 91.1206.8, 91.1206.9,

10



91.1206.9.1, 91.1206.10, 91.1206.11, 91.1206.12, 91.1206.13, 91.1206.14,
91.1206.14.1, 91.1206.14.2, 91.1206.15.4, 91.1206.16 and 91.1206.17.

Sec. 26. Subsection 91.1207.14.3 of Section 91.1207, Division 12, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is renumbered as Subsection 91.1206.14.3 and amended in its
entirety to read as follows:

91.1206.14.3. Airport Noise Sources. Residential structures and all other structures
identified in LAMC Subsection 91.1206.1 located where the annual Lsn or CNEL (as
defined in California Code of Regulations, Title 21, Division 2.5, Chapter 6, Section
5001) exceeds 60 db, shall require an acoustical analysis showing that the proposed
design will achieve the prescribed allowable interior level.

EXCEPTION: New single-family detached dwellings and all non-
residential noise sensitive structures located outside the noise impact boundary
of 65 db CNEL are exempt from LAMC Section 91.1206.

Alterations or additions to all noise sensitive structures, within the 65 db and
greater CNEL shall comply with LAMC Section 91.1206. If the addition or alteration
cost exceeds 75% of the replacement cost of the existing structure, then the entire
structure must comply with LAMC Section 91.1206.

For public-use airports or heliports, the Lan or CNEL shall be determined from the
Aircraft Noise Impact Area Map prepared by the Airport Authority. For military bases,
the Lan shall be determined from the facility Air Installation Compatible Use Zone
(AICUZ) plan. For all other airports or heliports, or public-use airports or heliports for
which a land-use plan has not been developed, the Lan or CNEL shall be determined
from the noise element of the general plan of the local jurisdiction.

When aircraft noise is not the only significant source, noise levels from all
sources shall be added to determine the composite site noise level.

Sec. 27. Section 91.1403, Division 14, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
renumbered as Section 91.1402 and amended to read as follows:

SEC. 91.1402. PERFORMANCE REQUIREMENTS.

Section 1402 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except Section 1402.3 of the
CBC is not adopted and in lieu, LAMC Subsection 19.1402.3 is added.

Sec. 28. Subsection 91.1403.3 of Section 91.1403, Division 14, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is renumbered as Section 91.1402.3.

Sec. 29. Section 91.1405, Division 14, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
deleted in its entirety.

11



Sec. 30. Section 91.1603, Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1603 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except CBC Section 1603.1.9
is not adopted and, in lieu, LAMC Subsection 91.1603.1.9 is added.

Sec. 31. The first sentence of Subsection 91.1603.1.9 of Section 91.1603,
Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Construction documents or specifications shall be prepared for those systems
and components requiring special inspection for seismic resistance as specified in CBC
Section 1705.12 by the registered design professional responsible for their design and
shall be submitted for approval in accordance with LAMC Subsection 91.106.3.3.

Sec. 32. The first and second sentences of Subdivision 12.11.2.2.3 of
Subsection 91.1613.5.3 of Section 91.1613, Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the
LAMC are amended to read as follows:

The anchorage of concrete or masonry structural walls to wood diaphragms shall
be in accordance with AWC SDPWS 4.1.5.1 and this section. Continuous ties required
by this section shall be in addition to the diaphragm sheathing.

Sec. 33. The Exception to Subsection 91.1613.5.5 of Section 91.1613, Division
16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

EXCEPTION: Reinforced concrete frame members not designed as part
of the seismic force resisting system shall comply with Section 18.14 of ACI 318.

Sec. 34. Subsection 91.1613.5.6 of Section 91.1613, Division 16, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 35. The second sentence of Subsection 91.1613.8.1.3.3 of Section
91.1613, Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Power supply for exit illumination shall comply with the requirements of CBC
Section 1008.3.

Sec. 36. Subsection 91.1613.9.5.4 of Section 91.1613, Division 16, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1613.9.5.4. Limitations. The following lateral-force-resisting elements shall not be
designed to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm in the downhill
direction:

1 Wood structural panel wall sheathing,

12



2. Cement plaster and lath,
3. Gypsum wallboard, and
4. Tension only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of CBC
Section 2205.2.1.2 may be used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and
diaphragm struts to the foundation, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural
stresses in any member of the frame or in the diaphragm struts. Deflections of
frames shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal members when the
frame is not rectangular,

Sec. 37. The second sentence of Subsection 91.1613,9.9.5.2 of Section
91.1613, Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Deflections of shear walls may be estimated by AWC SDPWS Section 4.3.2.

Sec. 38. The first sentence of the last unnumbered paragraph of Subsection
91.1613.9.9.6 of Section 91.1613, Division 16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of CBC Section
2205.2.1.2 may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the direction normal
to the downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any
member of the frame.

Sec. 39. The Exception to Subsection 91.1613.10.2 of Section 91.1613, Division
16, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A building selected by the State of California as part of its
Strong Motion Instrumentation Program (California Public Resources
Code Section 2700 et seq.) need not comply with this section until it
ceases to be part of the program.

2. All new buildings that are designed using the non-linear
response history procedure of “Seismic Response History Procedures” of
Chapter 16 of ASCE 7 shall be equipped with a structural monitoring
system in accordance with standards established by the Superintendent of
Building.

3. A building designed using a two-stage analysis procedure
per Section 12.2.3.2 of ASCE 7 having a flexible upper portion above a

13



rigid lower portion and a total building height not exceeding 85 feet above
the grade plane.

Sec. 40. The title of Section 91.1702, Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the
LAMC is amended to read as follows:

SEC. 91.1702. NEW MATERIALS.

Sec. 41. Subsection 91.1702.1 of Section 91.1702, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 42. Section 91.1703 of Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1703 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except Sections 1703.1,
1703.2, 1703.3, 1703.4, 1703.4.1, and 1703.4.2 of the CBC are not adopted;
and, in lieu LAMC Subsections 91.1703.1, 91.1703.2, 91.1703.3, 91.1703.4,
91.1703.4.1, and 91.1703.4.2 are added.

Sec. 43. Subsection 91.1703.1.1 of Section 91.1703, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 44. Subsection 91.1703.4.1 of Section 91.1703, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1703.4.1. Research and Investigation. Sufficient technical data shall be submitted
to the Superintendent of Building to substantiate the proposed use of any product,
material or assembly. If it is determined that the evidence submitted is satisfactory
proof of performance for the use intended, the Superintendent of Building shall approve
the use of the product, material or assembly subject to the requirements of this Code.
The costs, reports and investigations required under these provisions shall be paid by
the permit applicant as required by LAMC Sections 98.0501, 98.0502 and 98.0503.

Sec. 45. Subsection 91.1703.4.2 of Section 91.1703, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1703.4.2. Research Reports. Supporting data, where necessary to assist in the
approval of products, materials or assemblies not specifically provided for in this Code,
shall consist of valid research reports from approved sources as required in LAMC
Sections 98.0501 and 98.0502.

Sec. 46. Subsection 91.1703.6 of Section 91.1703, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter iX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 47. Section 91.1704 of Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

14



Section 1704 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except that CBC Sections
1704.2, 1704.2.1,1704.2.3, 1704.2.4, 1704.2.5, 1704.2.5.1, 1704.2.5.2, 1704.6,
1704.6.2, 1704.7, 1704.8 and 1704.9 are not adopted; and, in lieu, LAMC Subsections
91.1704.1.1, 91.1704.1.2, 91.1704.1.3, 91.1704.1.4, 91.1704.1.5, 91.1704.1.6,
91.1704.1.7, 91.1704.2, 91.1704.2.1, 91.1704.2.1.1, 91.1704.2.1.2, 91.1704.2.1.3,
91.1704.2.3, 91.1704.2.4, 91.1704.2.5, 91.1704.2.5.1, 91.1704.2.5.2, 91.1704.6, and
91.1704.6.2 are added or amended, to read as follows:

Sec. 48. Subsections 91.1704.1, 91.1704.1.1, 91.1704.1.2, 91.1704.1.3,
91.1704.1.4, 91.1704.1.5, and 91.1704.1.6, of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC are renumbered respectively as Subsections 91.1704.1.1,
91.1704.1.2, 91.1704.1.3, 91.1704.1.4, 91.1704.1.5, 91.1704.1.6, and 91.1704.1.7.

Sec. 49. Subsection 91.1704.2 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1704.2, Special Inspections. Where application is made for construction as
described in this section, the owner or the registered design professional in responsible
charge acting as the owner's agent shall employ one or more Registered Deputy
Inspectors to perform inspections during construction on the types of work listed under
CBC Section 1705. The Registered Deputy Inspector shall be a qualified person as set
forth in LAMC Subsection 91.1704.2.1 and shall demonstrate competence to the
satisfaction of the Superintendent of Building for inspection of the particular type of
construction or operation requiring special inspection.

The special inspections shall be in addition to the inspections made by the
employees of the Department as set forth in LAMC Section 91.108.

All special inspections shall be made by a Registered Deputy Inspector.
Whenever the term "Special Inspector” is used in this Code, it shall mean "Registered
Deputy Inspector” as described in LAMC Subdivision 91.1704.2.1.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Special inspections are not required for construction of a
minor nature or as warranted by conditions in the jurisdiction as approved
by the Superintendent of Building.

2 Unless otherwise required by the Superintendent of Building,
special inspections are not required for Group U occupancies that are
accessory to a residential occupancy including, but not limited to, those
listed in CBC Section 312.1.

3. Special inspections are not required for portions of structures
designed and constructed in accordance with the cold-formed steel light-

15



frame construction provisions of CBC Section 2211.7 or the conventional
light-frame construction provisions of CBC Section 2308.

4. The contractor is permitted to employ the approved agencies
where the contractor is also the owner.

Sec. 50. Subsection 91.1704.2.1 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1704.2.1. Registered Deputy Inspector Qualifications. An applicant for Deputy
Inspector shall provide written documentation to the Superintendent of Building
demonstrating his or her competence and relevant experience or training. Experience
or training shall be considered relevant when the documented experience or training is
related in complexity to the same type of special inspection activities for projects of
similar complexity and material qualities. These qualifications are in addition to
qualifications specified in other sections of this Code.

Application for registration as a Registered Deputy Inspector shall be made to the
Superintendent of Building on a form furnished by the Department. A separate
application shall be made for each type of registration desired. Registration is available
for the following types of inspections: Reinforced Concrete (RC), Structural Masonry
(SM), Structural Steel/Welding (SSW), Grading (GD), Sprayed Fire resistant Materials
(SFRM), Methane Barrier (MB) and Wood (WD).

A committee appointed by the Superintendent of Building shall examine each
applicant as to his or her experience and training for performing the duties of an
inspector of the type for which application has been made. Additionally, the applicant
will be examined on the applicant’s knowledge of the LAMC and Registered Deputy
Inspector duties, responsibilities and procedures. When satisfied as to the fitness of the
applicant, the Superintendent of Building shall issue a Certificate of Registration. Upon
application for renewal of a Certificate of Registration, the applicant shall be re-
examined to ascertain the applicant's fitness to perform the duties of inspector of the
type for which application has been made.

EXCEPTION: if the Department determines that the initial examination
(which includes general knowledge, code requirements and plan comprehension)
for the special inspector program under the International Code Council (ICC) is
equivalent to the above-described initial or renewal examination, then the
Department may accept the results of the ICC examination in lieu of the
Department's examination in that category; however, the Department will be
examining the applicant's knowledge of the LAMC and Registered Deputy
Inspector duties, responsibilities and procedures

The Superintendent of Building shall issue a separate Certificate of Registration
for each type of registration requiring special inspection in accordance with LAMC

16



Section 91.1704 and as determined by the Superintendent of Building for any
construction requiring either continuous or periodic special inspection.

Nothing here shall be deemed to prohibit any one persen from being qualified for
more than one type of special inspection, provided he or she applies, pays the required
fees, takes the required examinations and is duly qualified by the Superintendent of
Building for each type.

Each Certificate of Registration shall expire three (3) years from the date of
issuance, but may be renewed by the Superintendent of Building within a grace period
of thirty (30) days thereafter.

The Department shall maintain a list of the names of all Registered Deputy
Inspectors, showing the type of work each has been authorized to inspect. This list
shall be available to the public.

Upon evidence satisfactory to the Superintendent of Building of incompetence, of
willful or negligent failure to observe or report violations of this Code, or of any other
failure to perform properly and effectively the duties assumed by a Registered Deputy
Inspector, the Superintendent of Building may revoke, suspend or refuse to renew any
Certificate of Registration. But, prior to that action, the holder shali be given an
opportunity to appear before the Superintendent of Building and be heard.

Except where there is a City employee inspecting buildings or structures being
erected or repaired by the City, no Registered Deputy Inspector shall receive any
compensation from the City. A Registered Deputy Inspector shali undertake and
perform the duties of inspection solely on the request of the owner or the owner's agent.
The designation shall be deemed to indicate that the duties incident to the inspection
are within the course and scope of the Registered Deputy Inspector's employment by
the owner or agent, and except where the Registered Deputy Inspector is in fact an
employee of the City, the Registered Deputy Inspector shall not be deemed an
employee of the City, a contractor, a subcontractor or a material vendor for any
purpose.

The registered design professional in responsible charge and engineers of record
involved in the design of the project are permitted to act as the supervising agency and
their personnel are permitted to act as the deputy inspector for the work designed by
them, provided they qualify as Registered Deputy Inspectors.

Sec. 51. Subsection 91.1704.2.3 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as foliows:

91.1704.2.3. Statement of Special Inspections. The permit applicant shall submit a

statement of special inspections in accordance with LAMC Subsection 91.106.3.3. The
statement of special inspections shall be prepared by the registered design professional

17



in responsible charge as a condition for permit issuance. This statement shall be in
accordance with LAMC Subsection 91.1704.3.

EXCEPTION:

1. A statement of special inspections is not required for
portions of structures designed and constructed in accordance with the
cold-formed steel light-frame construction provisions of CBC Section
2211.1.2 or the conventional light-frame construction provisions of LAMC
Section 91.2308.

Sec. 52. Subsection 91.1704.2.4 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1704.2.4. Report Requirement. In addition to all the requirements of LAMC
Subsection 91.1704.2.1.1, Registered Deputy Inspectors shall keep records of
inspections and tests. The Registered Deputy Inspectors shall fumnish inspection
reports and tests to the Superintendent of Building, and to the registered design
professional in responsible charge. Reports shall indicate that work inspected was or
was not completed in conformance to approved construction documents. Discrepancies
shall be brought to the immediate attention of the contractor for correction. If they are
not corrected, the discrepancies shall be brought to the attention of the Superintendent
of Building and to the registered design professional in responsible charge prior to the
completion of that phase of the work. A final report documenting required special
inspections and tests, and correction of any discrepancies noted in the inspections or
tests, shall be submitted at a point in time agreed upon prior to the start of the work by
the owner or owner’s authorized agent to the Superintendent of Building.

Sec. 53. Subsection 91.1704.2.5 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1704.2.5. Special Inspection of Fabricated Items. Where fabrication of structural,
load-bearing or lateral load resisting members or assemblies is being conducted on the
premises of a fabricator’'s shop, deputy inspections of the fabricated items shall be
performed during fabrication, when approved by the Superintendent of Building, except
where the fabricator has been approved to perform work without special inspection in
accordance with LAMC Subsection 1704.2.5.1.

Sec. 54. Subsection 91.1704.2.5.1 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 55. Subsection 91.1704.2.5.2 of Section 1704, Division 17, Article 1,

Chapter IX of the LAMC is renumbered as Subsection 91.1704.2.5.1 and amended in its
entirety to read as follows:

18



91.1704.2.5.1. Fabricator Approval. Pursuant to LAMC Section 96.200 et seq.,
special inspections required by LAMC Section 91.1705 are not required where the work
is done on the premises of a fabricator approved to perform such work without special
inspection. Approval shall be based upon review of the fabricator’s written fabrication
procedures and quality control manuals that provide a basis for control of materials and
workmanship, with periodic auditing of fabrication and quality control practices by an
approved agency or the Superintendent of Building. At completion of fabrication, the
approved fabricator shall submit a certificate of compliance to the owner or owner’s
authorized agent for submittal to the Superintendent of Building as specified in CBC
Section 1704.5 stating that the work was performed in accordance with the approved
construction documents.

Sec. 56. Subsection 91.1704.3 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 57. Subsection 91.1704.3.1 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter [X of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 58. Subsection 91.1704.4 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 59. The first paragraph of Subsection 91.1704.6 of Section 91.1704,
Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Where required by the provisions of LAMC Subsections 91.1704.6.1,
91.1704.6.2, or 91.1704.6.3, the owner shall employ the registered design professional
in responsible charge for the structural design, or another registered design professional
designated by the registered design professional in responsible charge of the structural
design to perform structural observations as defined in CBC Section 202.

Sec. 60. Subsection 91.1704.6.1 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 61. Subsection 91.1704.6.2 of Section 91.1704, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1704.6.2. Structural Observations for Seismic Resistance. Structural
observations shall be provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F where one or more of the following conditions exist:

1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Ill or IV.

2 The structure is classified as Risk Category | or ll in accordance
with CBC Table 1604.5, and a lateral design is required for the structure or
portion thereof.

19



EXCEPTION: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U
Occupancies less than 2,000 square feet (185.8 m 2) in area, provided the
adjacent grade is not steeper than 1-unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10%
sloped), assigned to Seismic Design Category D.

1. When so designated by the registered design professional
responsible for the structural design.

2 When such observation is specifically required by the
Department.

Sec. 62. Section 91.1705 of Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

Section 1705 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except CBC Sections 1705.3,
1705.3.2, 1705.6, 1705.7, 1705.8, 1705.11.1, 1705.11.4, 1705.12.1, 1705.12.1.1,
1705.16.2 and 1705.17 are not adopted; and, in lieu, LAMC Subsections 91.1705.1.2,
91.1705.1.3, 91.1705.1.4, 91.1705.1.5, 91.1705.1.6, 91.1705.1.7, 91.1705.1.8,
91.1705.1.9, 91.1705.1.10, 91.1705.1.11, 91.1705.1.12, 91.1705.1.13, 91.1705.2.4,
91.1705.3, 91.1705.3.1.2, 91.1705.3.2, 91.1705.6, 91.1705.6.2, 91.1705.7, 91.1705.8,
91.1705.12.1, 91.1705.12.1.1.1, 91.1705.13.1, 91.1705.17.2 and 91.1705.18, and Table
1705.3 are added.

Sec. 63. Subsection 91.1705.1.1 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 64. Subsection 91.1705.1.2 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as foliows:

91.1705.1.2. Certifications by Engineer or Geologist. If the grading or foundation
earthwork has required continuous inspection, the responsible engineering geologist or
soils engineer shall certify by signature to the Department that, to the best of his or her
knowledge, the field work was completed in conformity with the technical design data.

Sec. 65. Subsection 91.1705.1.8 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.1.8. Registration. The procedures and conditions of registration as a Special
Activity Inspector shall be the same as applicable to a Registered Deputy Inspector
under LAMC Subsection 91.1704.2.1, except that the extent and duration of special
inspection authority shall be as specified in the rules and regulations adopted by the
Superintendent of Building.

Sec. 66. Subsection 91.1705.1.9 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

20



91.1705.1.9. Duties. Except as otherwise indicated by regulations promulgated by the
Superintendent of Building, the duties and responsibilities for a Special Activity
Inspector shall be the same as specified for a Registered Duty Inspector under LAMC
Subsection 91.1704.2.1.1.

Sec. 67. Subsection 91.1705.1.10 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.1.10. Fees. The procedures for the examination, registration and renewal of
authority as a Special Activity Inspector shall be the same as specified for a Registered
Deputy Inspectors under LAMC Subsection 91.1704.2.1.2.

Sec. 68. Subsection 91.1705.1.11 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.1.11. Renewal Process. LAMC Subsection 91.1704.2.1.2 applies to the
application, examination and renewal process for registration as a Special Activity
Inspector.

Sec. 69. Subsection 91.1705.2.2 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 70. Subsection 91.1705.3 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.3. Concrete Construction. Special inspections and tests of concrete
construction shall be performed in accordance with this section and LAMC Table
1705.3.

EXCEPTION: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for:

1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories
or less above grade plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where
the structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive
strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2
MPa).

2 Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings
three stories or less above grade plane that are fully supported on earth or
rock where:

2.1. The footings support walls of light-frame construction;

2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with LAMC
Table 1809.7; or

21



2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a
specified compressive strength, f'c, not more than 2,500 pounds
per square inch (psi) (17.2 MPa), regardless of the compressive
strength specified in the approved construction documents or used
in the footing construction.

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the
ground, including prestressed slabs on grade, where the effective
prestress in the concrete is less than 150 psi (1.03 MPa).

4, Concrete foundation walls constructed in accordance with
CBC Table 1807.1.6.2.

5. Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks on grade.

Sec. 71. Table 1705.3 following Subsection 91.1705.3 of Section 91.1705,

Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as
follows:

[Intentionally Blank]

22



TABLE 1705.3

REQUIRED VERIFICATION AND INSPECTION OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

concrete members.

CONTINUOUS [PERIODIC |REFERENCED|LABC
TYPE SPECIAL SPECIAL STANDARD? |REFERENCE
INSPECTION |[INSPECTION
1. Inspect reinforcement, including ACI 318: Ch.
prestressing tendons, and verify — X 20, 25.2,25.3, |1908.4
placement. 26.6.1-26.6.3
2. Reinforcing bar welding: X
a. Verify weldability of reinforcing :
bars other than ASTM A706;  |— X z‘gs D1.4
b. Inspect single-pass fillet welds, 1 318: -
maximum?®1¢”; and 26.6.4
c. Inspect all other welds. X
3. Inspect anchors cast in concrete. | — X ACl 318: —
17.8.2
4. Inspect anchors post-installed in
hardened concrete members.®
a. Adhesive anchors installed in
horizontally or upwardly inclined )
orientations to resist sustained |x ACI 318: —
tension loads. 17.8.2.4
b. Mechanical anchors and
adhesive anchors not defined in ACI| 318:
4.a. X 17.8.2
ACI 318: Ch. [1904.1, 1904.2,
5. Verify use of required design mix. |— X 19, 26.4.3, 1908.2, 1908.3
26.4.4
6. Prior to concrete placement,
fabricate specimens for strength tests, 22$m g;jI,zACl
perform slump and air content tests, X — 318: 26.5 1908.10
and determine the temperature of the 26 1 2 it
concrete. ’
7. Inspect concrete and shotcrete 1908.6, 1908.7,
placement for proper application X — AC| 318: 26.5 (1908.8
techniques.
8. Verify maintenance of specified F X ACIl 318: 1908.9
curing temperature and techniques. 26.5.3-26.5.5 '
9. Inspect prestressed concrete for:
a  Application of prestressing X —
forces; and ACl 318: 26.10 |—
b  Grouting of bonded prestressing [X
tendons.
10. Inspect erection of precast - X AClI 318:26.9 |—

23




11. Verify in-situ concrete strength,

prior to stressing of tendons in post- ACI 318:

tensioned concrete and prior to removal|— X 26.11.2 ’ —

of shores and forms from beams and T

structural slabs.

12. Inspect formwork for shape, ACI 318:

location and dimensions of the concrete|— X 26.11.1 .2(b) —

member being formed. RS

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm.

a. Where applicable, see CBC Section 1705.12, special inspections for seismic
resistance.

b. Specific requirements for special inspection shall be included in the

research report for the anchor issued by an approved source in
accordance with 17.8.2 in ACI 318, or other qualification procedures.
Where specific requirements are not provided, special inspection
requirements shall be specified by the registered design professional and
shall be approved by the building official prior to the commencement of the
work.

Sec. 72. Subsection 91.1705.3.1 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 73. Subsection 91.1705.3.2 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.3.2. Material Tests. In the absence of sufficient data or documentation
providing evidence of conformance to quality standards for materials in Chapters 19 and
20 of ACI 318, the Superintendent of Building shall require testing of materials in
accordance with the appropriate standards and criteria for the material in Chapters 19
and 20 of ACI 318. Weldability of reinforcement, except that which conforms to ASTM
A 7086, shall be determined in accordance with the requirements of Section 26.6.4 of
ACI 318.

Sec. 74. The first sentence of Subsection 91.1705.6 of Section 91.1705, Division
17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Special inspections defined per LAMC Subsections 91.7008.2 and 91.7011.3 and
tests for existing site soil conditions, fill placement and load-bearing requirements shall
be as required by this section and LAMC Table 1705.6.

Sec. 75. Subsection 91.1705.6.1 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is renumbered as 91.1705.6.2.

Sec. 76. Subsection 91.1705.7 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

24



91.1705.7. Driven Deep Foundations and Connecting Grade Beams. Special
inspections and tests shall be performed during installation and testing of the driven
deep foundation elements as specified by CBC Table 1705.7. The approved
geotechnical report, required by CBC Section 1803.6 and the construction documents
prepared by the registered design professionals shall be used to determine compliance.
Special inspections for connecting grade beams shall be in accordance with LAMC
Section 91.1705.3.

Sec. 77. Subsection 91.1705.8 of Section 19.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.8. Cast-in-Place Deep Foundations and Connecting Grade Beams.
Special inspections and tests shall be performed during installation and testing of cast-
in-place deep foundation elements as specified by CBC Table 1705.8. The approved
geotechnical report, required by CBC Section 1803.6 and the construction documents
prepared by the registered design professionals shall be used to determine compliance.
Special inspections for connecting grade beams shall be in accordance with LAMC
Section 91.1705.3.

Sec. 78. Subsection 91.1705.12.1 of Section 91.1705, Division 17, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1705.12.1. Structural Steel. Special inspection for seismic resistance shall be in
accordance with CBC Sections 1705.12.1.1 or 1705.12.1.2, as applicable and during
the fabrication and erection of buildings over 160 feet (48,768 mm) in height with
structural steel moment resisting frames. A registered deputy inspector shall be present
during the performance of all structural welding or the installation of all high-strength
bolts whether in a fabricator’s shop or at the job site.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Single-pass filiet welds not exceeding 5/16-inch (7.9 mm) in
size.

2. Floor and roof deck welding.

Sec. 79. The Exception to Subsection 91.1705.13.1 of Section 91.1705, Division
17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is deleted.

Sec. 80. Section 91.1707, Division 17, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 81. Subsections 91.1707.1 and 91.1707.2 of Section 91.1707, Division 17,
Chapter IX of the LAMC are deleted in their entirety.

25



Sec. 82. The second sentence of Subsection 91.1807.1.4 of Section 91.1807,
Division 18, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

Lumber and plywood shall be treated in accordance with AWPA Ul (Commaodity
Specification A, Use Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall be identified in accordance
with CBC Section 2303.1.9.1.

Sec. 83. A new Subsection 91.1808.7.1.1 is added to Section 91.1808, Division
18, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC to read as follows:

91.1808.7.1.1. Exception to CBC Section 1808.7.1. An Exception to CBC Section
1808.7.1 is an open deck or patio not covered with a roof or other overhead structure,
which shall not be considered a building for the specific application of the building
clearance pursuantto CBC Section 1808.7.1 and CBC Figure 1808.7.1.

Sec. 84. The first sentence of Subsection 91.1810.3.3.1.4 of Section 91.1810,
Division 18, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended to read as follows:

The assumed frictional resistance developed by any uncased cast-in-ptace deep
foundation element shall not exceed one-sixth (1/6) of the bearing value of the soil
material at minimum depth as set forth in CBC Table 1806.2, up to a maximum of 500
psf (24 kPa), unless a greater value is allowed by the Department on the basis of a
geotechnical investigation as specified in LAMC Section 91.1803 or a greater value is
substantiated by a load test in accordance with CBC Section 1810.3.3.1.2.

Sec. 85. Section 91.1900 of Division 19, Article 1, Chapter IX of the LAMC is
amended to read as follows:

Chapter 19 of the CBC is adopted by reference, except that CBC Sections
1905.1,1905.1.7, and 1906.1 are not adopted; and, in lieu, LAMC Subsections
91.1905.1, 91.1905.1.7, 91.1905.1.9, 91.1905.1.10, 91.1905.1.11, 91.1905.1.12, and
91.1906.1 are added.

Sec. 86. Subsection 91.1905.1.7 of Section 91.1900, Division 19, Article 1,
Chapter IX of the LAMC is amended in its entirety to read as follows:

91.1905.1.7. ACI 318, Section 14.1.4. Delete ACI 318, Section 14.1.4, and replace
with the following:

14.1.4 - Plain concrete in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D,
E
orF.

14.1.4.1 - Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F shall not
have elements of structural plain concrete, except as follows:

26



